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SUBARTICLE 105-8.13.3 is deleted and substituted as follows: 

  105-8.13.3 Dynamic Testing Engineer (DTE): Provide a Dynamic Testing 
Engineer in responsible charge of the performance of the dynamic load testing of driven piles, 
evaluation, signal matching and analysis of the dynamic load test data, the establishment of the 
production pile lengths (when these are to be determined based on test pile information) and 
driving criteria. Production pile lengths and driving criteria shall be developed by the same 
engineering firm, and under the same DTE analyzing the dynamic pile testing data in 
conjunction with the GFDEOR. The DTE must be a Professional Engineer registered in the state 
of Florida with responsible charge experience of geotechnical foundation construction 
engineering and dynamic testing of driven piles for a period of not less than three years including 
at least three Department bridge projects. This “responsible charge” experience shall include 
verifiable experience using the test methods that will be utilized on the project. The DTE must 
have a rank of Intermediate or higher in the PDCA/PDI Dynamic Measurement and Analysis 
Proficiency Test. 
 
 

SUBARTICLE 105-8.13.4 is deleted and substituted as follows: 

 
  105-8.13.4 Dynamic Testing Operator: Provide a Dynamic Testing Operator 
(DTO) to perform the dynamic load testing of instrumented piles and test piles in the field. The 
DTO must have a rank of Intermediate or higher in the PDCA/PDI Dynamic Measurement and 
Analysis Proficiency Test.  When EDCs will be used to monitor piles and/or test piles, EDC 
monitoring shall be performed by an operator who has passed EDC Monitoring Certification as 
evidenced by a Smart Structures valid Certification Card and ID. The operator must have 
experience in geotechnical foundation construction and dynamic testing of driven piles for a 
period of not less than two years including at least three Department bridge projects. The 
experience may have been obtained while working under the supervision of another qualified 
operator. The Dynamic Testing Operator shall work under the supervision of the DTE.  
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