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REVISED “BID SHEET” (Page 1 of 24) – updated July 21, 2023 
 

 
BID #: DOT-ITB-24-9003-CA      BID TITLE: ATTENUATOR PARTS 
 

 
Trinity Industries/Energy Absorption Brand 

 
 

Award will be made to an authorized Florida Distributor for Trinity Industries/Energy Absorption. 
 
Bidders will supply for each item the quantity that can be shipped in a box and on a pallet. Price shall 
be for each item, not per box or pallet. The Department will decide if orders are to be shipped via box 
or pallet based on Warehouse/Distribution needs. Orders for quantities fitting 5 or more pallets will be 
shipped on pallets via Freight Company unless otherwise requested by the Department. Orders for 
quantities less than 5 pallets will be shipped in boxes unless otherwise requested by the Department. 
 
Please include a list of any additional repair parts. This list will not be part of the award but will be added 
as part of the final contract for the awarded vendor. List must include item description, model #, APL # 
and unit price. You may attach a spreadsheet with the additional items or use the enclosed table. 
 
Box/Pallet orders may be made up of multiple items?      Yes or   No 
 

ITEM # Description/Model # Estimated 
Annual 
Usage 

Unit Price Total Price Awarded 
Vendor 

1A Panel, Thrie Beam Fender 
Brand: GREAT     Part #2738111-0000 
DOT COMMODITY#107101  
APL #___________________ 

40 each $ $ NO BID 

2A Mushroom Bolt Assembly w/Deflect  
Brand: GREAT    Part #27Thrie 
Beam52650-0000 
DOT COMMODITY #107109 
APL # ___________________ 

15 each $ $ NO BID 

3A Diaphragm Assy Thrie Beam 24” 
Brand: GREAT    Part #3519061-0000 
DOT COMMODITY #107121 
APL #___________________ 

26 each $ $ NO BID 

4A Diaphragm Assy, Thrie Beam 30” 
Brand: GREAT    Part #3519062-0000 
DOT COMMODITY #107122 
APL#___________________ 

4 each $ $ NO BID 

5A Diaphragm Assy, Thrie Beam 36” 
Brand: GREAT    Part #3519063-0000 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

4 each $ $ NO BID 

6A Nose Assembly Cone, Universal 
Brand: GREAT    Part #3502080-0000 
DOT COMMODITY #107126 
APL#___________________ 

139 each $ $ NO BID 

7A Cartridge, Hex Foam II, Type #51 
Brand: GREAT    Part #3509510-0000 
DOT COMMODITY #107134 
APL #___________________ 

777 each $ $ NO BID 
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8A QuadGuard Monorail 1 Bay QG,G 
Part #2760051-0000 
DOT COMMODITY # 108412 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

9A QuadGuard Monorail 2 Bay QG,G 
Part #2760061-0000 
DOT COMMODITY # 108413 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

10A QuadGuard Monorail 3 Bay QG,G 
Part #2760071-0000 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

11A QuadGuard Diaphragm Assembly 24” 
Part #3540071-0000 
DOT COMMODITY # 108416 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

12A QuadGuard Diaphragm Assembly 36” 
Part #3540073-0000 
DOT COMMODITY # 108418 
APL#___________________ 

2 each $ $ NO BID 

13A QuadGuard Diaphragm Assembly 30” 
Part #3540073-0000 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

14A QuadGuard High Speed Diaphragm 24” 
Part #3540015-0000 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

15A QuadGuard High Speed Diaphragm 30”  
Part #3540016-0000 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

16A QuadGuard High Speed Diaphragm 36” 
Part #3540017-0000 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each 
 

$ $ NO BID 

17A QuadGuard High Speed Bumper Assembly 24”  
Part #3546021-0000 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

18A QuadGuard High Speed Bumper Assembly 30” 
Part #3546022-0000 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

19A QuadGuard High Speed Bumper Assembly 36” 
Part #3546023-0000 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

20A QuadGuard High Speed Nose Assembly 24”/30” 
Part #3640611-0000 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 
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21A QuadGuard High Speed Nose Assembly 36” 
Part #3540612-0000 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

22A QuadGuard Nose Assembly Gray 24”/30”/36ˮ 
Part #3540050-0000 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________  

24 each $ $ NO BID 

23A QuadGuard Nose Assembly Gray 69”/ 90” 
Part #3540131-0000 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

24 each $ $ NO BID 

24A QuadGuard Fender PNL ASSY  24”/30”/36” QGII 
Part #3540040-0000 
DOT COMMODITY # 108421 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

25A QuadGuard Fender PNL ASSY  69”/90” QGII 
Part #3540370-0000 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

26A QuadGuard Cartridge Assy Type I QGII 
Part #3540010-0000 
DOT COMMODITY #108450 
APL#___________________ 

17 each $ $ NO BID 

27A QuadGuard Cartridge Assy Type II QGII 
Part #3540020-0000 
DOT COMMODITY #108451 
APL#___________________ 

15 each $ $ NO BID 

28A QuadGuard metal spring die QGII 
Part #2715343-0000 
DOT COMMODITY #NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

29A Lid – Black Energite III 
Part #2731251-0200 
DOT COMMODITY #107035 
APL#___________________ 

10 each $ $ NO BID 

30A 1400 lb. Sand Container Energite III 
Part #2731191-0100 
DOT COMMODITY #107034 
APL#___________________ 

5 each $ $ NO BID 

31A 2100 lb. Sand Container Energite III 
Part #2731261-0100 
DOT COMMODITY #107036 
APL#___________________ 

5 each $ $ NO BID 

32A 200 / 400 lb. Inner Cone Energite III 
Part #2731201-0000 
DOT COMMODITY #107032 
APL#___________________ 

5 each $ $ NO BID 

33A 700 lb. Inner Cone Energite III 
Part #2731271-0000 
DOT COMMODITY #107033 
APL#___________________ 

5 each $ $ NO BID 
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34A QuadGuard M10 

Mash TL-3 devices 
Part # 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

35A Steel Nose Assembly QG II, 24”/30”/36” Yellow 
Part #003540042-01 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

36A Steel Nose Assembly QG II, 69”/90”, Yellow 
Part #003540043-01 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

37A Steel Nose Assembly QG II, 48”, Yellow 
Part #003540044-01 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

 38A Shim Kit, Rail Guide, QG II 
Part #003540078-00 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

39A Nose Piece, Yellow TRACC 05  
Part #6531B 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

40A SLED WELDMENT TRACC 05 
Part #25970A 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

41A FRAME WELDMENT TRACC 05 
Part #25971A 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

42A BACKUP FRAME WELDMENT TRACC 05 
Part #25972A 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

43A 2 BAY FENDER PANEL ASSEMBLY TRACC 05 
Part #25973A 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

44A 1 BAY FENDER PANEL ASSEMBLY TRACC 05 
Part #25974A 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

45A SLOT PLATE WELDMENT TRACC 05 
Part #25976A 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

46A TRACC 05 STAGE 1 RIP PLATE REPAIR KIT 
Part #09TR05STG1 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 
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47A TRACC 05 STAGE 2 RIP PLATE REPAIR KIT 
Part #09TR05STG2 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

48A TRACC 05 STAGE 3 RIP PLATE REPAIR KIT 
Part #09TR05STG3 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

49A SHORT TRACC 05 STAGE 1 RIP PLATE REPAIR 
KIT     Part #09ST05STG1 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

50A SHORT TRACC 05 STAGE 2 RIP PLATE REPAIR 
KIT    Part #09ST05STG2 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

 51A SHORT TRACC 05 STAGE 3 RIP PLATE REPAIR 
KIT     Part #09ST05STG3 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

52A QG Elite BELT NOSE ASSY, 24”/30”, Gray or yellow 
Part #003540495-00 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

53A QG Elite BELT NOSE ASSY, 36”, Gray or yellow 
Part #003540504-00 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

54A QG Elite BELT NOSE ASSY, 69”/90”, Gray or yellow 
Part #003540575-00 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

55A Cylinder Assembly, QG Elite 1 
Part #606646B 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

56A Cylinder Assembly, QG Elite 2 
Part #606647B 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

57A Elite Diaphragm Assembly, 24” QG Elite 
Part #003540464-00 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

58A Elite Diaphragm Assembly, 24” QG Elite 
Part #003540465-00 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

59A Elite Diaphragm Assembly, 24” QG Elite 
Part #003540466-00 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 
 

1 each $ $ NO BID 
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60A Elite Fender Panel Assembly, QG Elite 
Part #003540585-00 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

62A Reflective Nose Narrow-Gore REACT 350  
Part #003535003-30 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

63A Reflective Nose Narrow-Left or Right REACT 350  
Part #003535003-40 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

64A Replacement Cylinder: 1, 5 or 6 REACT  350 
Part #4100-2 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

 65A Replacement Cylinder: 2, 3 or 4 REACT  350 
Part #4100 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

66A Reflective Nose Narrow-Gore, REACT II; REACT 
350 II        Part #00617967B 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

67A Reflective Nose Narrow-left or right, REACT II; RECT 
350 II     Part #00617968B 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

68A Replacement Cylinder: 1, 5 or 6; REACT 350 II  
Part #4100-2 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

69A Replacement Cylinder: 2, 3 or 4; REACT 350 II  
Part #4100 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

 

 

  Grand Total (A) Trinity Industries/Energy Absorption Brand (1-69) $______________ 
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BID #: DOT-ITB-24-9003-CA      BID TITLE: ATTENUATOR PARTS 
 

 

     Lindsay Transportation Brand 
Award will be made to an authorized Florida Distributor for Lindsay Transportation. 

 

Bidders will supply for each item the quantity that can be shipped in a box and on a pallet. Price shall 
be for each item, not per box or pallet. The Department will decide if orders are to be shipped via box 
or pallet based on Warehouse/Distribution needs. Orders for quantities fitting 5 or more pallets will be 
shipped on pallets via Freight Company unless otherwise requested by the Department. Orders for 
quantities less than 5 pallets will be shipped in boxes unless otherwise requested by the Department. 
 
Please include a list of any additional repair parts. This list will not be part of the award but will be 
added as part of the final contract for the awarded vendor. List must include item description, model 
#, APL # and unit price. You may attach a spreadsheet with the additional items or use the enclosed 
table. 
 
Box/Pallet orders may be made up of multiple items?         X  Yes or   No 
 

ITEM # Description/Model # Estimated 
Annual 
Usage 

Unit Price Total Price Awarded 
Vendor 

1B Sliding Fender Panel 
Brand: TAU II – Part #B010202 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL# 544-000-045 

1 each 

$700.00 $700.00 
Cloverleaf 

Corporations 

2B Mid Support Diaphragm 
Brand: TAU II – Part #B010530 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#544-000-045 

1 each 

$1,500.00 $1,500.00 
Cloverleaf 

Corporations 

3B Nose Assembly – black 
Brand: TAU II – Part #B030516 
DOT COMMODITY # 
APL#544-000-045 

1 each 

$700.00 $700.00 
Cloverleaf 

Corporations 

4B Slider Bolt Assembly 
Brand: TAU II – Part #B020212 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#544-000-045 

1 each 

$375.00 $375.00 
Cloverleaf 

Corporations 

5B Cartridge Type A 
Brand: TAU II – Part #B010802 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#544-000-045 

1 each 

$650.00 $650.00 
Cloverleaf 

Corporations 

6B Cartridge Type B 
Brand: TAU II – Part #B010722 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#544-000-045 

1 each 

$650.00 $650.00 
Cloverleaf 

Corporations 

7B Front Support Leg 
Brand: TAU II – Part #K001005 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#544-000-045 

1 each 

$150.00 $150.00 
Cloverleaf 

Corporations 

8B Front Support Diaphragm 
Brand: TAU-11 – Part #B010530 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT 
ASSIGNED 
APL#544-000-045 

1 each 

$1000.00 $1,000.00 
Cloverleaf 

Corporations 
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9B XL Bulkhead  
Brand: TAU-11 – Part #B030521W 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT 
ASSIGNED 
APL#544-000-045 

1 each 

$2,000.00 $2,000.00 
Cloverleaf 
Corporations 

10B TAU-M 
Mash TL-3 devices 
Part # 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT 
ASSIGNED 
APL#544-001-004 

1 each 

$19,900.00 $19,900.00 
Cloverleaf 
Corporations 

11B TAU-M TL-2 
Mash TL-2 devices 
Part # 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT 
ASSIGNED 
APL#544-002-001 

1 each 

$15,000.00 $15,000.00 
Cloverleaf 
Corporations 

 

Grand Total (B) Lindsay Transportation Brand (1-11) $42,625.00 
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BID #: DOT-ITB-24-9003-CA      BID TITLE: ATTENUATOR PARTS 
 
   

Traffix Devices Brand 
 

Award will be made to an authorized Florida Distributor for Traffix Devices. 
 
Bidders will supply for each item the quantity that can be shipped in a box and on a pallet. Price shall 
be for each item, not per box or pallet. The Department will decide if orders are to be shipped via box 
or pallet based on Warehouse/Distribution needs. Orders for quantities fitting 5 or more pallets will be 
shipped on pallets via Freight Company unless otherwise requested by the Department. Orders for 
quantities less than 5 pallets will be shipped in boxes unless otherwise requested by the Department. 
 
Please include a list of any additional repair parts. This list will not be part of the award but will be 
added as part of the final contract for the awarded vendor. List must include item description, model 
#, APL # and unit price. You may attach a spreadsheet with the additional items or use the enclosed 
table. 
 
Box/Pallet orders may be made up of multiple items?      Yes or    X     No 
 

ITEM # Description/Model # Estimated 
Annual Usage 

Unit Price Total Price Awarded 
Vendor 

1C Trailer Mounted Attenuator - MASH 
Test Level 3 Scorpion II 
Model # 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $28,950.00 $28,950.00 

Striping 
Service 
and 
Supply 

2C Truck Mounted Attenuator   
Test Level 3 Scorpion II 
Model # 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $26,950.00 $26,950.00 

Striping 
Service 
and 
Supply 

3C Delta TL-3 Crash Cushion - MASH 
Model #75000 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $22,950.00 $22,950.00 

Striping 
Service 
and 
Supply 

4C Front Attenuation Module Kit, Includes 
Installation Hardware: 4 bolts (3/8”-16 x 1-
1/4”) & 4 washers (3/8”) 
Stock #75220-N-4Y 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $1,495.00 $1,495.00 

Striping 
Service 
and 
Supply 

5C Front Impact Head Kit, Includes: 4 wing 
washers, 4 nuts (3/4”-10), & 12 washers 
(3/4”) 
Stock #75230-N-KIT 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 
 

1 each $2,775.00 $2,775.00 

Striping 
Service 
and 
Supply 

6C Front Module Object Marker Kit w/Yellow 
Reflective Sheeting, Pattern on Black 
Background, includes Hardware: 6 bolts 
(1/4”-20x3/4”) & 6 washers (1/4:”) 
Stock #75221-MO-4Y 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $175.00 $175.00 

Striping 
Service 
and 
Supply 
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7C Steel Diaphragm (9 per system) 

Stock #75240N 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $995.00 $995.00 Striping 
Service 
and 
Supply 

8C Track Weldment – Complete 
Stock #75250-TL3-N 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $6,995.00 $6,995.00 Striping 
Service 
and 
Supply 

9C Fender Panel (1N), kit includes hardware: 2 
wing washers, 2 lock nuts (3/4”-10), & 2 
washers (3/4”)  
(2 per system) 
Stock #75260-TL3-1N-KIT 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $715.00 $715.00 

Striping 
Service 
and 
Supply 

10C Fender Panel (2N), kit includes hardware: 2 
wing washers, 2 lock nuts (3/4”-10), & 2 
washers (3/4”)  
(2 per system) 
Stock #75260-TL3-2N-KIT 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $715.00 $715.00 

Striping 
Service 
and 
Supply 

11C Fender Panel (3N), kit includes hardware: 2 
wing washers, 2 lock nuts (3/4”-10), & 2 
washers (3/4”)  
(2 per system) 
Stock #75260-TL3-3N-KIT 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $718.00 $718.00 

Striping 
Service 
and 
Supply 

12C Fender Panel (45N), kit includes hardware: 
2 wing washers, 2 lock nuts (3/4”-10), & 2 
washers (3/4”)  
(4 per system) 
Stock #75260-TL3-45N-KIT 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $725.00 $725.00 

Striping 
Service 
and 
Supply 

13C Steel Transition for Bi-Directional Traffic 
Flow, Left, with Hardware Mounting Kit 
Stock #75270-LH-KIT 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $2,850.00 $2,850.00 
Striping 
Service 
and 
Supply 

14C Steel Transition for Bi-Directional Traffic 
Flow, Right, with Hardware Mounting Kit 
Stock #75270-RH-KIT 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $2,850.00 $2,850.00 
Striping 
Service 
and 
Supply 

15C Wing Washer Kit, includes: 1 wing washer, 
1 lock nut (3/4”-10), & 1 washer (3/4”) 
Stock #75207-KIT 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 
 

1 each $85.00 $85.00 
Striping 
Service 
and 
Supply 

16C Concrete Anchor Kit, includes: 39 Anchor 
Rods  
(7/8”-9x8”), 39 nuts (7/8”-9), & 39 washers 
(7/8”) Stock #75208-CA-KIT 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $1,350.00 $1,350.00 
Striping 
Service 
and 
Supply 
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17C Asphalt Anchor Kit, includes: 39 Anchor 
Rods  
(7/8”-9x8”), 39 nuts (7/8”-9), & 39 washers 
(7/8”)  
Stock #75218-AA-KIT 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $1,800.00 $1,800.00 

Striping 
Service 
and 
Supply 

18C Concrete Anchor Kit, includes: 1 Anchor 
Rod  
(7/8”-9x8”), 1 nut (7/8”-9), & 1 washer (7/8”) 
(39 per system) 
Stock #75208-CA 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $45.00 $45.00 

Striping 
Service 
and 
Supply 

19C Asphalt Anchor Kit, includes: 1 Anchor Rod  
(7/8”-9x8”), 1 nut (7/8”-9), & 1 washer (7/8”) 
(39 per system) 
Stock #75218-AA 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $60.00 $60.00 

Striping 
Service 
and 
Supply 

20C Floating Diaphragm Hardware Kit, includes: 
4 bolts (1/4”-20x1-3/4”), 4 lock nuts (1/4”-
20), & 8 washers (1/4”)   (5 kits per system) 
Stock #75230-HW-KIT 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $205.00 $205.00 

Striping 
Service 
and 
Supply 

21C Front Attenuation Module Hardware Kit, 
Includes: 4 bolts (3/8”-16x1-1/4”) & 4 
washers (3/8”) 
Stock #75220-HW-KIT 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $40.00 $40.00 

Striping 
Service 
and 
Supply 

22C Steel Transition Hardware Mounting Kit, 
includes: 3 anchor bolts (3/4”), 10 lag bolts 
(3/8”), 10 self-tapping metal screws (3/8”), 
& 5 blockout brackets 
Stock #75720-HW-KIT 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $345.50  $345.50  Striping 
Service 
and 
Supply 

 

 
Grand Total (C) Traffix Devices Brand (1-22) $103,788.00  
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BID #: DOT-ITB-24-9003-CA      BID TITLE: ATTENUATOR PARTS 
 

Gregory Devices Brand 
 

Award will be made to an authorized Florida Distributor for Gregory Devices. 
 
Bidders will supply for each item the quantity that can be shipped in a box and on a pallet. Price shall 
be for each item, not per box or pallet. The Department will decide if orders are to be shipped via box 
or pallet based on Warehouse/Distribution needs. Orders for quantities fitting 5 or more pallets will be 
shipped on pallets via Freight Company unless otherwise requested by the Department. Orders for 
quantities less than 5 pallets will be shipped in boxes unless otherwise requested by the Department. 
 
Please include a list of any additional repair parts. This list will not be part of the award but will be 
added as part of the final contract for the awarded vendor. List must include item description, model 
#, APL # and unit price. You may attach a spreadsheet with the additional items or use the enclosed 
table. 
 
Box/Pallet orders may be made up of multiple items?      Yes or    X    No 

 

1D TTMA-200 
Trailer Mounted Attenuator 
Part # BH-TTMAFL w/ Arrow Board 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#102-063-002 

1 each $23,937.00 $23,937.00 
Cloverleaf 

Corporations 

 

      
 

Grand Total (D) Gregory Devices Brand (1) $23,937.00 
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BID #: DOT-ITB-24-9003-CA      BID TITLE: ATTENUATOR PARTS 
 
 
     SCI Smart Cushion Brand 
 

Award will be made to an authorized Florida Distributor for SCI Smart Cushion. 
 
Bidders will supply for each item the quantity that can be shipped in a box and on a pallet. Price shall 
be for each item, not per box or pallet. The Department will decide if orders are to be shipped via box 
or pallet based on Warehouse/Distribution needs. Orders for quantities fitting 5 or more pallets will be 
shipped on pallets via Freight Company unless otherwise requested by the Department. Orders for 
quantities less than 5 pallets will be shipped in boxes unless otherwise requested by the Department. 
 
Please include a list of any additional repair parts. This list will not be part of the award but will be 
added as part of the final contract for the awarded vendor. List must include item description, model 
#, APL # and unit price. You may attach a spreadsheet with the additional items or use the enclosed 
table. 
 
Box/Pallet orders may be made up of multiple items?      Yes or   No 
 

ITEM # Description/Model # Estimated 
Annual 
Usage 

Unit Price Total Price Awarded 
Vendor 

1E Bolt Kit Concrete Anchor 3/4” X 7” TL3 
Brand: SCI    Part #270667 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 kit/48 pcs $585.00 $585.00 Striping 
Service and 
Supply 

2E Bolt Kit Asphalt Anchor 3/4” X 18” TL3 
Brand: SCI    Part #270663 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 kit/48 pcs $843.00 $843.00 Striping 
Service and 
Supply 

3E Bolt Kit Concrete Anchor 3/4” X 7” TL2 
Brand: SCI    Part #270666 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 kit/34 pcs $434.00 $434.00 Striping 
Service and 
Supply 

4E Bolt Kit Asphalt Anchor 3/4 “ X 18” TL2 
Brand: SCI    Part #270664 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $529.00 $529.00 Striping 
Service and 
Supply 

5E SSCI100GM MASH 
Mash TL-3 devices 
Brand:                          Part # 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $29,400.00 $29,400.00 Striping 
Service and 
Supply 

6E Epoxy Kit for TL3 Concrete Attenuator 
Brand: SCI    Part #272612 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $234.00 $234.00 Striping 
Service and 
Supply 

7E Epoxy Kit for TL3 Asphalt Attenuator 
Brand: SCI     Part #272610 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 
 

1 each $697.00 $697.00 Striping 
Service and 
Supply 
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8E Epoxy Kit for TL2 Concrete Attenuator 
Brand: SCI    Part #272611 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $174.00 $174.00 Striping 
Service and 
Supply 

9E Epoxy Kit for TL2 Asphalt Attenuator 
Brand: SCI    Part #272609 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $522.00 $522.00 Striping 
Service and 
Supply 

 10E Nozzle Epoxy Mixing 
Brand: SCI    Part #273113 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $4.00 $4.00 Striping 
Service and 
Supply 

11E Dispenser Epoxy 
Brand: SCI    Part #2701946 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $330.00 $330.00 Striping 
Service and 
Supply 

12E Bolt Shear 
Brand: SCI    Part #270683 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $2.30 $2.30 Striping 
Service and 
Supply 

13E Reset Parts Kits TL3 
Brand: SCI    Part #272621 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $165.00 $165.00 Striping 
Service and 
Supply 

14E Reset Parts for Kit TL2 
Brand: SCI    Part #272620 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $149.00 $149.00 Striping 
Service and 
Supply 

15E Panel Side TL2 & TL3 
Brand: SCI    Part #273401 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $320.00 $320.00 Striping 
Service and 
Supply 

16E Panel Sled 
Brand: SCI    Part #273402 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $709.00 $709.00 Striping 
Service and 
Supply 

17E Panel Rear 
Brand: SCI    Part #273399 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $280.00 $280.00 Striping 
Service and 
Supply 

18E Keeper Side #3 (Sled Panels) TL2 & TL3 
Brand: SCI    Part #272597 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $43.00 $43.00 Striping 
Service and 
Supply 

19E Keeper Side #1 (Side Panels) TL2 & TL3 
Brand: SCI    Part #272593 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $39.00 $39.00 Striping 
Service and 
Supply 

20E Sled (with guide rollers) 24” TL3 
Brand: SCI    Part #274649 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $3,371.00 $3,371.00 Striping 
Service and 
Supply 
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21E Sled (with guide rollers) 24” TL2 

Brand: SCI    Part #274648 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $3,171.00 $3,171.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 

22E Panel Delineator (Painted Yellow) TL3 
Brand: SCI    Part #273378 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $155.00 $155.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 

 23E Panel Delineator (Painted Black) TL3 
Brand: SCI    Part #273386 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $150.00 $150.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 

24E Panel Delineator Diamond Grade Chevron 6 
inch stripes TL3    Brand: SCI    Part 
#273381 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $258.00 $258.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 

25E Panel Delineator Diamond Grade Left 6 inch 
stripes TL3    Brand: SCI    Part #273383 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 kit/48 pcs. $258.00 $258.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 

26E Panel Delineator Diamond Grade Right 6 
inch stripes TL3    Brand: SCI     Part 
#273389 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 kit/48 pcs. $258.00 $258.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 

27E Panel Delineator (Painted Yellow) TL2 
Brand: SCI    Part #273380 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 kit/34 pcs. $139.00 $139.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 

28E Panel Delineator (Painted Black) TL2 
Brand: SCI    Part #273385 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $135.00 $135.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 

29E Panel Delineator Diamond Grade Chevron 6 
inch stripes TL2    Brand: SCI    Part 
#27382 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $242.00 $242.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 

30E Panel Delineator Diamond Grade Left 6 inch 
stripes TL2    Brand: SCI    Part #233928 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $242.00 $242.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 

31E Panel Delineator Diamond Grade Right 6 
inch stripes TL2    Brand: SCI    Part 
#273388 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $242.00 $242.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 

32E Panel Delineator TL3 Yellow HIP - Florida 
Brand: SCI     Part #271883 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

33E Panel Delineator TL2 Yellow HIP - Florida 
Brand: SCI     Part #271882 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each. $ $ NO BID 
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34E Boot Cylinder TL3 
Brand: SCI     Part #270707 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each. $81.00 $81.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 

35E Boot Cylinder TL2 
Brand: SCI    Part #233937 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 kit/34 pcs. $81.00 $81.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 

36E Bracket Cable Hold Down 
Brand: SCI    Part #265243 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $27.00 $27.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 

37E Tool Anti Rotation Pin Removal 
Brand: SCI    Part #273994 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $34.00 $34.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 

38E Anchor Drop-In 
Brand: SCI    Part #270069 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $10.00 $10.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 

39E Cable Release Tool 
Brand: SCI    Part #275224 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $15.00 $15.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 

40E Shear Bolt Removal Tool 
Brand: SCI    Part #238247 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $77.00 $77.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 

41E Hole Brush-Nylon 
Brand: SCI    Part #270952 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $15.00 $15.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 

42E SCI Debris Hood Assembly-DH3 
Brand: SCI    Part #262004 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $2,359.00 $2,359.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 

43E Fiberglass Stay Kit for Debris Hood-DH3 
Brand: SCI    Part #262006 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each. $141.00 $141.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 

44E Tool Drop-in Anchor Setting 
Brand: SCI    Part #264383 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each. $7.00 $7.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 

45E Transition Jersey Barrier - Right 
Brand: SCI    Part #275297 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

46E Transition Jersey Barrier - Left 
Brand: SCI    Part #275294 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 
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47E Transition Jersey Barrier MASH R 

Brand: SCI    Part #268892 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $1,979.00 $1,979.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 

48E Transition Jersey Barrier MASH L 
Brand SCI    Part #268891 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $1,979.00 $1,979.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 

49E Bracket Jersey Barrier Support MASH R  
Brand: SCI    Part #268894 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $330.00 $330.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 

50E Bracket Jersey Barrier Support MASH L  
Brand: SCI    Part #268893 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $330.00 $330.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 

51E Support Plate JB Median Barrier Temp 
MASH 
Brand: SCI    Part #232807 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $425.00 $425.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 

52E Transition Single Slope 24-26 9/32” Wide 
Median Barrier – Right    Brand: SCI    Part 
#275299 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $2,192.00 $2,192.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 

53E Transition Single Slope 24-26 9/32” Wide 
Median Barrier – Left    Brand: SCI    Part 
#275302 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $2,192.00 $2,192.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 

54E Transition 24” Concrete – Left & Right 
Brand: SCI    Part #275263 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $1,243.00 $1,243.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 

55E Transition Thrie Beam - Right 
Brand: SCI    Part #275298 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $1,795.00 $1,795.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 

56E Transition Thrie Beam - Left 
Brand: SCI    Part #232971 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $1,795.00 $1,795.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 

57E Transition W Beam 28” High Right 
Brand: SCI    Part #275309 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $2,276.00 $2,276.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 

58E Transition W Beam 28” High Left 
Brand: SCI    Part #275307 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $2,276.00 $2,276.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 

59E Transition W Beam 32” High Right 
Brand: SCI    Part #275311 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 
 

1 each $2,090.00 $2,090.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 
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60E Transition W Beam 32” High Left 
Brand: SCI    Part #275310 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $2,090.00 $2,090.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 

61E Blockout Steel Tube 
Brand: SCI    Part #265580 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $234.00 $234.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 

62E Transition Spanner – Left & Right 
Brand: SCI    Part #251641 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $1,444.00 $1,444.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 

63E Transition Assembly 30” Concrete Straight 
Connection 
Brand: SCI     Part #275279 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $3,541.00 $3,541.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 

64E Transition Assembly 36” Concrete Straight 
Connection 
Brand: SCI   Part #275283 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $6,225.00 $6,225.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 

65E Transition Assembly Wide Gore 
Brand: SCI    Part #275288 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNE 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $9,155.00 $9,155.00 Striping 
Service and 

Supply 
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66E Thrie Beam Concrete Leg Brace 

Brand: SCI    Part #270765 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $1,169.00 $1,169.00 Striping Service 
and Supply 

67E PWB02 Block Out 
Brand: SCI    Part #233449 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $155.00 $155.00 Striping Service 
and Supply 

68E Transition Assembly Variable Width 
Barrier with Rub Rails    Brand: SCI    
Part #239542 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $6,872.00 $6,872.00 Striping Service 
and Supply 

69E Transition Assembly Variable Width 
Barrier without Rub Rails    Brand: SCI    
Part #239545 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $5,660.00 $5,660.00 Striping Service 
and Supply 

70E Transition Assembly Variable Width 
Single Slope 
Brand: SCI    Part #275287 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

71E Panel Delineator Diamond Grade Right 
6 inch stripes TL3    Brand: SCI    Part 
#273389 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

72E Transition W Beam 28” High Left 
Brand: SCI    Part #275307 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

73E Transition W Beam 32” High Right 
Brand: SCI    Part #275311 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

74E Transition W Beam 32” High Left 
Brand: SCI    Part #275310 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

75E Blockout Steel Tube 
Brand: SCI    Part #265580 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

76E Transition Spanner – Left & Right 
Brand: SCI    Part #251641 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

77E Transition Assembly 30” Concrete 
Straight Connection 
Brand: SCI    Part #275279 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 

78E Transition Assembly 36” Concrete 
Straight Connection 
Brand: SCI    Part #275283 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ $ NO BID 
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79E Transition Assembly Wide Gore 
Brand: SCI    Part #275288 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT 
ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ 

NO BID 

80E Thrie Beam Concrete Leg Brace 
Brand: SCI    Part #270765 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT 
ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ 

NO BID 

81E PWB02 Block Out 
Brand: SCI    Part #233449 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT 
ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ 

NO BID 

82E Transition Assembly Variable Width 
Barrier with Rub Rails    Brand: SCI    
Part #239542 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT 
ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ 

NO BID 

83E Transition Assembly Variable Width 
Barrier without Rub Rails    Brand: 
SCI    Part #239545 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT 
ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ 

NO BID 

84E Transition Assembly Variable Width 
Single Slope 
Brand: SCI    Part #275287 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT 
ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 

1 each $ 

NO BID 

 

 
     Grand Total (E) SCI Brand (1-84) $104,374.30 
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BID #: DOT-ITB-24-9003-CA      BID TITLE: ATTENUATOR PARTS 
 
 
     Verdegro Devices Brand 
 

Award will be made to an authorized Florida Distributor for Verdegro Devices 
 
Bidders will supply for each item the quantity that can be shipped in a box and on a pallet. Price shall 
be for each item, not per box or pallet. The Department will decide if orders are to be shipped via box 
or pallet based on Warehouse/Distribution needs. Orders for quantities fitting 5 or more pallets will be 
shipped on pallets via Freight Company unless otherwise requested by the Department. Orders for 
quantities less than 5 pallets will be shipped in boxes unless otherwise requested by the Department. 
 
Please include a list of any additional repair parts. This list will not be part of the award but will be 
added as part of the final contract for the awarded vendor. List must include item description, model 
#, APL # and unit price. You may attach a spreadsheet with the additional items or use the enclosed 
table. 
 
Box/Pallet orders may be made up of multiple items?      Yes or   No 
 

ITEM # Description/Model # Estimated 
Annual Usage 

Unit Price Total Price 

1F Truck Mounted Attenuator - MASH 
Test Level 3; Blade TMA 
Part # 
DOT COMMODITY # NOT ASSIGNED 
APL#___________________ 
 

 
 
1 each 

 
 
$ 

NO BID 

 
 

Grand Total (F) Verdegro Brand (1) $_____________ _ 
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BID #: DOT-ITB-24-9003-CA      BID TITLE: ATTENUATOR PARTS 
 
 

 
 

 

AWARD WILL BE MADE TO AN AUTHORIZED FLORIDA DISTRIBUTOR FOR ITEMS BID 
 
 

Sub Totals: 
 

A) Trinity Industries/Energy $ No Bid    
  Absorption 
 

B)  Lindsay Transportation   $ 42,625.00  (Cloverleaf Corporations) 
 
 

C) Traffix Devices Brand   $ 103,788.50 (Striping Service and Supply) 
 
 

D) Gregory Devices Brand   $ 23,937.00 (Cloverleaf Corporations)  
 
 
E) SCI Smart Cushion Brand  $ 104,374.30 (Striping Service and Supply)  
 

 
F)  Verdegro Brand    $ No Bid    

 
 
 

GRAND TOTAL  $ 66,562.00 (Cloverleaf Corporations) 
    $ 208,162.80 (Striping Service and Supply) 
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Spread Sheet for Additional Parts 
(Not part of the award)  Use additional sheets as needed. 

 

ITEM # Description / Model # / Part # Unit Price Total Price 

  
 
 
APL #___________________ 

$ $ 

  
 
 
APL # ___________________ 

$ $ 

  
 
 
APL # ___________________ 

$ $ 

  
 
 
APL # ___________________ 

$ $ 

  
 
 
APL # ___________________ 

$ $ 

  
 
 
APL # ___________________ 

$ $ 

  
 
 
APL # ___________________ 

$ $ 

  
 
 
APL #___________________  

$  $ 

  
 
 
APL #___________________  

$  $ 

  
 
 
APL #___________________  

$  $ 

  
 
 
APL #___________________  

$  $ 

  
 
 
APL #___________________  

$  $ 

  
 
 
APL #___________________  
 

$  $ 

 

 



 

ORDERING INSTRUCTIONS 
 
 
Bid Number:  DOT-ITB-24-9003-CA 
 
Title:    ATTENUATOR PARTS                                                                                                       
 
 
NOTE:  ALL ORDERS SHOULD BE DIRECTED TO: 
 

FEDERAL EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER (FEID):  F59-3133525-002    
 

VENDOR:       Cloverfleaf Corporation                                                                              
 
ADDRESS:       Post Office Box 7268                                                                           

 
CITY, STATE, ZIP:           Sun City, Florida 33586                                                       
 
TELEPHONE:       (813) 649-1336                                                                               

       
TOLL FREE NO.:                                              
 

 

DELIVERY: DELIVERY WILL BE MADE WITHIN     30     DAYS AFTER RECEIPT OF PURCHASE 
ORDER.  
 
 

PRODUCT INFORMATION: DIRECT QUESTIONS TO: 
 

NAME & TITLE:            Matthew Schindler, President                                                                                                         

ADDRESS:          Post Office Box 7268                                                                                                                                    

CITY, STATE, ZIP:          Sun City, Florida 33586                                                                                                           

TELEPHONE:    813   /     649-1336                                                                                                                             

TOLL FREE NO.:                                              FAX NO.:    813   /  645-5577              

 

INTERNET E-MAIL ADDRESS:        matthew@cloverleafcorp.com                            

INTERNET WEBSITE URL:        www.cloverleafcorp.com                             

 

Will you accept the State of Florida Purchasing Card (VISA)?    X   Yes ____No 

 

 



 

ORDERING INSTRUCTIONS 
 
 
Bid Number:  DOT-ITB-24-9003-CA 
 
Title:    ATTENUATOR PARTS                                                                                                       
 
 

NOTE:  ALL ORDERS SHOULD BE DIRECTED TO: 
 

FEDERAL EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER (FEID): F46-4727229-001  
 

VENDOR:           Striping Service and Supply, Inc.                                                           
 
ADDRESS:             212 Hickman Drive                                                             

 
CITY, STATE, ZIP:         Sanford, Florida                                                                    
 
TELEPHONE:        407-562-4290                                                                               

       
TOLL FREE NO.:       800-590-1598                        

 

 
DELIVERY: DELIVERY WILL BE MADE WITHIN     30     DAYS AFTER RECEIPT OF PURCHASE 
ORDER.  
 
 
PRODUCT INFORMATION: DIRECT QUESTIONS TO: 
 

NAME & TITLE:         Michael Caffrey / Southeast VP, Business Development                                                                  

ADDRESS:           212 Hickman Drive                                                                                                                           

CITY, STATE, ZIP:       Sanford, Florida 32771                                                                                                                

TELEPHONE:     352-263-0646                                                                                                                                     

TOLL FREE NO.:       800-590-1598                     

 

INTERNET E-MAIL ADDRESS:       mcaffrey@aramsco.com     

INTERNET WEBSITE URL: www.stripingserviceandsupply.com        

 

Will you accept the State of Florida Purchasing Card (VISA)?     X  Yes ____No 

 

mailto:mcaffrey@aramsco.com
http://www.stripingserviceandsupply.com/

