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BID SOLICITATION NOTICE g District 6
FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 

CONSTRUCTION AND MAINTENANCE PROGRAMS 
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Advertisement No. ,-

All bids must be completed using Project Bids software available on the Bid Express website at Q[[WZ5++KRM_*LVT+OS+TJRU#

Unless otherwise stipulated in the proposal description, bids for all projects listed in this Bid Solicitation Notice must be 
submitted using Bid Express only. No other means of submission of bids will be accepted. Please visit the Contracts 
Administration Website at: http://www.fdot.gov/contracts  for more information on Bid Express. Submitting bids through 
Bid Express requires a Digital ID. To obtain a Digital ID, please contact Bid Express at http://www.bidx.com. Allow up to 6 
days to complete the Digital ID registration. 

Bids for the projects in this Bid Solicitation Notice will be accepted by Bid Express until --5,,8? Local Time on

143547329, /29#)'&#)')'.

Bid totals for each bid submitted will be read aloud for those present and will be available at --5,,8? /29#)'&#)')' in 

the JKV]N#YNONYNULNM#SVLJ[RVU*. Agenda: a) Opening Remarks; b) 15 minutes of public input; c) Reading of bids; d) 
Closing. Anyone needing special accommodations under the Americans with Disabilities Act of 1990 should send an e-

mail to: contracts.admin@dot.state.fl.us or call telephone number &/,1'03,)1013. Special accommodation requests under 
the Americans with Disabilities Act should be made at least seven days prior to the public meeting. Bidders may obtain 

preliminary bid results at: Q[[WZ5++OMV[^W-*MV[*Z[J[N*OS*\Z+^F9RM>N[[RUP+>N[[RUP?JRU, select district then click on 

appropriate date. 

DEADLINE FOR PROPOSALS AND PROPOSAL HOLDERS LIST 

The deadline for obtaining bid packages shall be 24 hours prior to the scheduled letting date and time. A list of plan 

holders may be obtained by visiting the District Contracts Administration website at: ^^^*OMV[*PV]+LVU[YJL[Z+M2, click 
pLetting and Project Informationq VcY hZaZXi aZii^c\ YViZ [gdb i]Z FZii^ngs Menu. For compliance with Florida Statute 
337.168(2), additional bidders and plan and specifications holders are not published beginning three working days prior to 
the letting. 

-----NOTE----- 

Proposals will not be issued after ((,''-/ Local Time on 0847329, /29#(+&#)')' . 

Document Ordering Information
Orders for documents are placed using the Contract Proposal Processing Online Ordering System at 

Q[[WZ5++OMV[^W-*MV[*Z[J[N*OS*\Z+LVU[YJL[WYVWVZJSWYVLNZZRUPVUSRUNVYMNYRUP+. There is no charge for 
ordering/downloading documents. Online Ordering is available Monday through Friday from 6 AM. to 9 PM. and 
Saturday from 6 AM. to 7 PM. 

#
To Place An Order 

' A current State of Florida Vendor Number is required prior to first-time registration; please visit 
http://dms.myflorida.com/egovernment_tools/myflorida_marketplace for more information. Please allow 24 to 48 
hours for receipt of a new vendor number. 

' Prior to placing orders, an individual shall register and establish an Internet Subscriber Account with the 

Department of Transportation at#Q[[WZ5++OMV[^W-*MV[*Z[J[N*OS*\Z+LVU[YJL[WYVWVZJSWYVLNZZRUPVUSRUNVYMNYRUP+. 
Please allow 48 to 72 hours (excluding weekends and holidays) for the registration and approval. 
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PREQUALIFICATION

Contractors must have a current certificate of qualification in accordance with Florida Statute 337.14(1) and Rule Chapter 
14-22, Florida Administrative Code, on the date of the letting to bid on construction projects over $250,000.00 as 
ZhiVWa^h]ZY Wn i]Z >ZeVgibZcirh WjY\Zi+ GV^ciZcVcXZ XdcigVXih Yd cdi gZfj^gZ V XdcigVXidg id ]VkZ V XZgi^[^XViZ d[ 
qualification, unless stipulated in the project description and specifications. If deemed necessary by the Department, 
certain maintenance contracts will contain specific requirements for maintenance contractor eligibility. 

PREQUALIFIED CONTRACTORS CURRENT CAPACITY 

Cc dgYZg [dg i]Z >ZeVgibZci id ]VkZ i]Z ^c[dgbVi^dc gZfj^gZY id YZiZgb^cZ V egZfjVa^[^ZY W^YYZgrh =jggZci =VeVX^in) ^i ^h 
necessary that the prequalified contractor certify the total dollar amount of all work the contractor has underway. This 
certification shall be accomplished electronically by submitting the Certification of Work Underway (Online Web 
Application) http://www.fdot.gov/contracts/PreQual_Info/prequalified.shtm to the Department every 30 calendar days. 

CONFLICT OF INTEREST

A contractor who performs a constructability review on a design contract or who participates in a value engineering study 
workshop or cost risk analysis workshop, is prohibited from bidding on the construction of that contract. 

SCRUTINIZED COMPANIES

A company that is on the Scrutinized Companies with Activities in Sudan List, is on the Scrutinized Companies with 
Activities in the Iran Petroleum Energy Sector List, or is engaged in business operations in Syria, may not bid on, submit a 
proposal for, or enter into a contract with an agency or local government entity for goods or services of $1 million or more. 

A company that is on the Scrutinized Companies that Boycott Israel List or is engaged in a boycott of Israel may not bid 
on, submit a proposal for, or enter into a contract with an agency or local government entity for goods or services.  

BID REJECTION 

Bidders are hereby notified that all bids on any of the following projects are likely to be rejected if the lowest responsive 
W^Y gZXZ^kZY ZmXZZYh i]Z Zc\^cZZgrh Zhi^bViZ Wn bdgZ i]Vc iZc eZgXZci &.-%'+ Cc i]Z ZkZci Vcn d[ i]Z W^Yh VgZ gZ_ZXiZY [dg 
this reason, the project may be deferred for re-advertising. In addition, award of all federally funded projects will be subject 
to Federal Highway Administration concurrence. 

PROTEST RIGHTS

Pursuant to Section 120.57, Florida Statutes, any person adversely affected by a bid solicitation shall file both a notice 
of protest and bond within 72 hours after posting of the Bid Solicitation Notice, and shall file a formal written protest within 
ten days after filing the notice of protest. Any person who files a notice of protest as to a bid solicitation pursuant to this 
rule shall post with the Department, at the time of filing the notice of protest, a bond payable to the Department in the 
following amounts: For an action protesting a bid solicitation that requires qualification of bidders, the bond shall be 
$5,000. For an action protesting a bid solicitation for which bidders are not required to be prequalified by the Department 
to be eligible to bid, the bond shall be $2,500. The required notice of protest, bond and formal protest must each be timely 
filed with the Clerk of Agency Proceedings, Florida Department of Transportation, Mail Station 58, Room 550, 605 

Suwannee Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0458, =8H#&41,'#0-0)1.20. Failure to file a protest within the time 
prescribed in Section 120.57(3), F.S., or failure to post the bond or other security required by law within the time allowed 
for the filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120, Florida Statutes. 

Pursuant to Section 120.57, Florida Statutes, any person adversely affected by a bid rejection or contract award shall 

file both a notice of protest and bond within 72 hours after the posting of the Summary of Bids. If notice of intended 

decision is given by certified mail or express delivery, the adversely affected person must file both the notice of protest 

and bond within 72 hours after receipt of the notice of intent. A formal written protest must be filed within ten days after 

filing the notice of protest. Any person who files a notice of protest as to a bid rejection or contract award pursuant to this 

rule shall post with the Department, at the time of filing the notice of protest, a bond payable to the Department in the 

following amounts: For an action protesting a bid rejection or contract award that requires qualification of bidders, the 

Bond shall be equal to one percent of the lowest bid submitted or $5,000, whichever is greater. For an action protesting a 

bid rejection or contract award for which bidders are not required to be prequalified by the Department to be eligible to bid, 
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the bond shall be $2,500. The required notice of protest, bond, and formal protest must each be timely filed with the Clerk 

of Agency Proceedings, Florida Department of Transportation, Mail Station 58, Room 550, 605 Suwannee Street, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0458, =8H#&41,'#0-0)1.20. Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 

120.57(3), Florida Statutes, shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120, Florida Statutes.#

A protest is not timely filed unless the notice of protest, bond, and the formal protest are each received by the Clerk of 
Agency Proceedings within the required time limits. A protest which is filed prematurely will be deemed abandoned unless 
timely renewed. 

Interested parties can visit our Internet web site at http://www.fdot.gov/contracts/. Information regarding projects posted 
with the Clerk of Agency Proceedings, Proposal holders, Plan and Special Provisions holders, preliminary letting results, 
and other noteworthy information is provided on this website. Please note that, for compliance with Florida Statute 
337.168(2), the Proposal holder and the Plan and Special Provision holder listings are not published beginning three 
working days prior to the letting until after the letting. 

In the event multiple responsive bidders submit identical proposals (bids), the Department will determine the order in 
which proposals are to be considered for Contract award in accordance with Florida Laws, and any applicable Rules. 

INSURANCE 

N]Z hjXXZhh[ja W^YYZg h]Vaa hjWb^i XjggZci \ZcZgVa a^VW^a^in ^chjgVcXZ VcY ldg`bVcrh XdbeZchVi^dc ^chjgVcXZ XZgi^[^XViZh 
for the duration of the contract in the dollar amounts and manner specified in the most current ZY^i^dc d[ i]Z >ZeVgibZcirh 
Standard Specifications for Road and Bridge Construction. Insurance companies must be authorized to do business in the 
State of Florida. Proof of such insurance shall be filed with the District Contracts and Procurement Office before the 
contract can be executed. BE SURE THAT THE CONTRACT NUMBER IS ON EACH INSURANCE CERTIFICATE. 

ADDENDA 

No negotiations, decisions, or actions will be initiated or executed by a potential bidder as a result of any oral discussion 
with a State employee. Only those communications which are in writing from the Department will be considered as a duly 
authorized expression on behalf of the Department. Notices of changes (addenda) will be posted on the Districts 

Contracts Administration website at: ^^^*OMV[*PV]+LVU[YJL[Z+M2) Xa^X` pLetting and Project Informationq VcY hZaZXi aZii^c\ 

date from the Lettings Menu. It is the responsibility of all potential bidders to monitor this site for any changing information 
prior to submitting their bid. All addenda will be acknowledged by signature and subsequent submission of 
addenda with the bid when so stated in the addenda.

BID QUESTIONS 

Direct questions regarding the advertised projects by posting them to the Department website at the following URL 

address:#Q[[WZ5++OMV[^W-*MV[*Z[J[N*OS*\Z+9RMC\NZ[RVUZ8UM8UZ^NYZ+BYVWVZJS*JZW_+ENJYLQBYVWVZJS.  

PROPOSAL GUARANTY 

For bids over $150,000.00, the standard proposal guaranty of 5% of the bid will be required, unless otherwise stipulated in 
the proposal advertisement. A Proposal Guaranty of not less than five percent (5%) of the total actual bid in the form of 
Z^i]Zg V XZgi^[^ZY X]ZX`) XVh]^Zgrh X]ZX`) igjhi XdbeVcn igZVhjgZgrh X]ZX`) WVc` YgV[i d[ Vcn cVi^dcVa dg state bank, or a 
Surety Proposal Guaranty made payable to the Florida Department of Transportation must be received for each bid in 
excess of $150,000.00. A check or draft in an amount less than five percent (5%) of the actual bid will invalidate the bid. 
The guaranty amount shall include all bid items except construction days for A+B bidding and lane closure for Lane 
Rental Bidding. Proposal Guaranty shall substantially conform to DOT Form 375-020-09 furnished with the Proposal. 
Surety2000 or SurePath electronic Proposal Guaranty submittal may be used in conjunction with Bid Express internet bid 
submittal. For more information please visit http://www.surety2000.com for Surety2000 or http://www.insurevision.com for 
SurePath. Paper Proposal Guaranty will also be accepted for bids submitted through Bid Express provided they are 
received prior to the deadline for receiving bids, by the location(s) identified in this Bid Solicitation Notice. If an electronic 
proposal guaranty is not being submitted, the bidder must submit an original proposal guaranty. (A fax or a copy sent as 
an attachment will not be accepted.) 
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EXECUTION OF CONTRACT

Pursuant to Subsections 3-6 and 3-7 of the Standard Specifications, the successful bidder shall execute the necessary 
contract documents and return the agreement along with a satisfactory Performance and Payment Bond within ten (10) 
Calendar days of award, excluding Saturdays, Sundays, and state holidays, unless noted otherwise in the project 
specifications. A 100% Payment and Performance Bond will be required for all projects unless noted otherwise in the 
project specifications. All work is to be done in accordance with the Plans, special Provisions of the State of Florida 
Department of Transportation. 

Prior to execution of the contract with the Department, a corporation must show proof that it is authorized to do 
business in the State of Florida. Florida corporations should provide a copy of the certificate of Incorporation and 
foreign corporations should provide a copy of Certificate of Authority from the Florida Department of State. 

Important Note: Actual commitment and final execution of the contract is contingent upon an approved legislative budget 
and funds availability. 

DBE PARTICIPATION

Disadvantaged Business Enterprise (DBE) Availability Goal Information is contained in the Bid Solicitation Package. DBE 
Participation and Bidder Opportunity List for Prime Contractors shall be reported in the Equal Opportunity Compliance 
(EOC) system no later than 3 business days of submission of the bid. The EOC system is a web based application for 
Prime Contractors, statewide, to report their Bidder Opportunity List, DBE Commitments, and DBE/MBE Subpayments. 
Complete and submit the DBE Participation (i.e. DBE Commitments) and Bid Opportunity List in the EOC.  

More information regarding EOC can be referenced at: Q[[WZ5++^^^*OMV[*PV]+NX\JSVWWVY[\UR[`+NVL*ZQ[T

DEBARMENT/SUSPENSION

All bids submitted to the Department shall include a statement that by signing and submitting this proposal, the bidder 
certifies that no principal (which includes officers, directors or executives) is presently debarred, suspended, proposed for 
debarment, declared ineligible or voluntarily excluded from participation in this transaction by any federal department or 
agency. 

MANDATORY PRE-BID CONFERENCE 

For projects with mandatory Pre-Bid Meeting, proposals (BIDDING DOCUMENTS) will be issued only to the attendees of 
the meeting. Prospective bidders ordering bidding documents prior to the Pre-Bid Meeting will be given access to 
download the bidding documents within 24 hours after the Pre-Bid Meeting. Those prospective bidders ordering the 
documents after the Pre-Bid Meeting will need to contact the office advertising the project to confirm attendance and 
receive access to download the bidding documents. Please contact the office at least two working days prior to the 
deadline for obtaining bidding documents to allow time for processing.

LATE ARRIVALS TO MANDATORY PRE-BID MEETINGS

All bidders must be present and signed in prior to the start of the mandatory pre-bid meeting. Anyone not signed in at the 
commencement of the meeting will be considered late and will not be allowed to bid on the project. 

FIRST TIME BIDDERS

<^YYZgh W^YY^c\ [dg i]Z [^ghi i^bZ l^i] i]Z >ZeVgibZci XVc VXXZhh i]Z HZl <^YYZgrh Ig^ZciVi^dc YdXjbZci Vi7 

Q[[WZ5++OMV[^^^*KSVK*LVYN*^RUMV^Z*UN[+ZR[NORUR[`+MVLZ+MNOJ\S[)ZV\YLN+LVU[YJL[Z+UN^)KRMMNYZ)

VYRNU[J[RVU*WMO7ZO]YZU6JNO-/-JNI.#

POSTING NOTICE

The bid tabulation and intent to award will be posted on .854#'+&#)')' or .854#)*&#)')' at ^^^*OMV[*PV]+LVU[YJL[Z+M2, 
Xa^X` i]Z pLetting and Project Informationq VcY hZaZXi aZii^c\ YViZ [gdb i]Z F^hi^c\h GZcj+ N]Z edhi^c\ egdk^YZh cdi^XZ d[ 
i]Z >ZeVgibZcirh ^ciZci id VlVgY V XdcigVXi dg gZ_ZXi Vaa W^Yh+ N]Z >ZeVgibZcirh Hdi^XZ d[ CciZci gZ\VgY^c\ V egd_ZXi l^aa WZ 
posted on only one of the alternate posting dates. Bidders are solely responsible for timely monitoring or otherwise 
verifying on which of the specified alternate posting dates the posting of award or rejection of all bids actually occurs. 



#

+52#/86515;0;587#-8;513# .043#*#

#

If the posting dates are revised, all bidders for the subject project will be notified. 

AFFIRMATIVE ACTION (EQUAL EMPLOYMENT OPPORTUNITY)

N]Z @adg^YV >ZeVgibZci d[ NgVchedgiVi^dc &]ZgZ^cV[iZg gZ[ZggZY id Vh i]Z p>ZeVgibZciq') ^c VXXdgYVcXZ l^i] Title VI of the 

Civil Rights Act of 1964, 42 USC 2000d to 2000d-4 and related authorities, Title 49, Code of Federal Regulations, 

U.S. Department of Transportation, Subtitle A, Office of the Secretary, Part 21, Nondiscrimination in Federally-

assisted programs of the U.S. Department of Transportation issued pursuant to such Act, hereby notifies all bidders that 

the Department will affirmatively insure that in any contract entered into pursuant to this advertisement, minority  and 

disadvantaged business enterprises will be afforded the full opportunity to submit bids in response to this invitation and 

will not be discriminated against on the basis of race, color, national origin, or sex in consideration for an award. Further, it 

is the policy of the Department to not discriminate against bidders on the grounds of race, color, national origin, religion, 

sex, age, or disability/handicap in consideration for an award. A bidder must have an approved DBE Affirmative Action 

(DBE/AA) Plan prior to contract award. Please use the following link Q[[WZ5++^^^*OMV[*PV]+LVU[YJL[Z+LWW)VUSRUN)

VYMNYRUP+KRMMNY)JZZRZ[*ZQ[T, Standard Specifications for Road and Bridge Construction and the Special Provisions for 

instructions for submission of a DBE/AA Plan. The DBE/AA Plan should be submitted for approval prior to the bidding.#

MINIMUM WAGE

The minimum wage for all hours worked in Florida is available at http://www.floridajobs.org. 

EMAIL SUBSCRIPTION LIST

To get on the e-mail subscription list, go to Q[[W5++OMV[^W-*MV[*Z[J[N*OS*\Z+YNWVY[Z\KZLYRW[RVUZ+ and fill out the necessary 
^c[dgbVi^dc id pMjWhXg^WZq+ Nd dWiV^c ^c[dgbVi^dc XdcXZgc^c\ di]Zg Y^hig^Xih) \d id #
http://www.fdot.gov/contracts/distco.shtm.  

NOTICE TO ALL BIDDERS 

To report bid rigging activities call: 1-800-424-9071 

The U.S. Department of Transportation (DOT) operates the above toll-[gZZ p]dia^cZq GdcYVn i]gdj\] @g^YVn) 57-- ;+G+ id 
5:00 P.M. Local Time. Anyone with knowledge of possible bid rigging, bidder collusion, or other fraudulent activities 
h]djaY jhZ i]Z p]dia^cZq id gZedgi hjX] VXi^k^i^Zh+ N]Z p]dia^cZq ^h eVgi d[ i]Z >INrh Xdci^cj^c\ Z[[dgi id ^YZci^[n VcY 
investigate highway construction contract fraud and abuse and is operated under the direction of the DOT Inspector 
General. All information will be treated confidentially and caller anonymity will be respected. 

By submitting a bid, the contractor/consultant/vendor agrees to comply with section 20.055(5).Florida Statute, and to 
incorporate in all subcontracts the obligation to comply with section 20.055(5) Florida Statute. 



Page Number Proposal Id Proposal Notes Fin Proj Numbers County

7 Z6123 4466271E201(*) MIAMI-DADE

11 Z6124 4466281E201(*) MONROE

15 Z6125-R0 4466291D201(*) MIAMI-DADE

16 Z6126-R0 4466301D201(*) MONROE

Please use the following proposal ID and the letting ID when ordering plans/proposal or specifications for the May 20, 
2020 letting.

Proposal Note Codes:

Page 6Bid Solicitation Notice - Notice to Contractors Index

Note: (*) indicates lead project

Notice to Contractors Index

Florida Department of Transportation

Published: April 20, 2020

Letting ID: 06200520



Florida Department of Transportation

Bid Solicitation Notice and Approximate Quantities

Letting: 06200520 Call Order: 001 Proposal: Z6123 District:06

Counties: MIAMI-DADE

Road Name: Emergency Sign Repair and Replacement - Miami-Dade County

Limits: Midpoint

Project(s): 4466271E201(*) Federal Aid No: N/A

Total Roadway Length: 0.000 Miles Contract Days: 365

Total Bridge Length: 0.000 Miles Letting Date: 05/20/20

Total Proposal Length: 0.000 Miles Contract Execution Days: 5

Special Start Date: N/A

Aquis/Flexible Start Time:

Proposal Budget Estimate: $1.00

Please read the full advertisement

Description:

Electronic bids are requested an Emergency (Pre-Event) contract to provide Sign Repair and Replacement Operations in Miami 
Dade County Within District Six. The contractor shall provide all equipment, supplies, and personnel necessary to complete the 
services described in Exhibit 'A' - Scope of Services. No quantities are guaranteed and there will be no unit cost adjustment for 
quantities required over or under the estimated quantities. 

EXPERIENCE REQUIREMENT: 
Contractors must submit the Experience form in Single and Multi-Post Signs, Form (# 850-070-08) as an attachment to your 
electronic bid or your bid may be found Non-Responsive.

ORDER BID DOCUMENTS: To request Bid Documents, please use the link below:

https://fdotwp1.dot.state.fl.us/contractproposalprocessingonlineordering/

SPECIAL NOTES: 

( No Bid Bond required

( No Pre-bid Conference

( Work will begin contingent upon legislative budget approval and availability of funds

( Awarded Contractor(s) must execute documents within five (5) workdays, excluding  weekends and state holidays

( Awarded Contractor(s) must provide and keep in force throughout the term of the contract General Liability and Workman's 
Compensation Insurance.  The State of Florida Department of Transportation shall be endorsed as additional insured with 
regards to general liability insurance.  

( Upon execution of the contract, the contractor must supply the Department with a letter from a surety authorized to do business 
in the State of Florida, verifying the contractor is bondable in the State of Florida in an amount equal to or greater than the 
amount of the original contract.  The performance bond will be required when work is authorized.

Submit your questions through Bid Question and Answer website and their respective answers will be also posted at this site. 
Please use the link below:

https://fdotwp1.dot.state.fl.us/BidQuestionsAndAnswers/Proposal.aspx/SearchProposal

Call Order: 001   Proposal: Z6123

ALT Item Description Unit Quantity

Page 7Bid Solicitation Notice - Proposal Item Quantities



Call Order: 001   Proposal: Z6123

ALT Item Description Unit Quantity

Section 0001 EMER.DELINEATOR/ATTENUATOR/SIGN REPR(EA)

0630-  2- 11 CONDUIT, FURNISH & INSTALL, OPEN TRENCH LF 100.000

0630-  2- 12 CONDUIT, FURNISH & INSTALL, DIRECTIONAL BORE LF 100.000

0630-  2- 14 CONDUIT, FURNISH & INSTALL, ABOVEGROUND LF 100.000

0630-  2- 15 CONDUIT, FURNISH & INSTALL, BRIDGE MOUNT LF 100.000

0632-  7-  2 SIGNAL CABLE- REPAIR/REPLACE/OTHER, FURNISH & INSTALL LF 100.000

0634-  4-142 SPAN WIRE ASSEMBLY, F&I, SINGLE POINT, DIAGONAL PI 1.000

0634-  4-152 SPAN WIRE ASSEMBLY, F&I, TWO POINT, DIAGONAL PI 1.000

0635-  2- 11 PULL & SPLICE BOX, F&I, 13" x 24" COVER SIZE EA 1.000

0635-  2- 12 PULL & SPLICE BOX, F&I, 24" X 36" COVER SIZE EA 1.000

0639-  1-111 ELECTRICAL POWER SERVICE, F&I, OVERHEAD, METER FURNISHED 
BY POWER COMPANY

AS 1.000

0639-  1-112 ELECTRICAL POWER SERVICE, F&I, OVERHEAD METER 
PURCHASED BY CONTRACTOR FROM POWER COMPANY

AS 1.000

0639-  1-113 ELECTRICAL POWER SERVICE, F&I, OVERHEAD METER NOT 
REQUIRED

AS 1.000

0639-  1-121 ELECTRICAL POWER SERVICE, F&I, UNDERGROUND, METER 
FURNISHED BY POWER COMPANY

AS 1.000

0639-  1-122 ELECTRICAL POWER SERVICE, F&I, UNDERGROUND, METER 
PURCHASED BY CONTRACTOR

AS 1.000

0639-  1-123 ELECTRICAL POWER SERVICE, F&I, UNDERGROUND, METER NOT 
REQUIRED

AS 1.000

0641-  2- 12 PRESTRESSED CONCRETE POLE, F&I, TYPE P-II SERVICE POLE EA 1.000

0641-  2- 15 PRESTRESSED CONCRETE POLE, F&I, TYPE P-V EA 1.000

0670-  4-  1 INTERSECTION CONTROL BEACON CONTROLLER ASSEMBLY, 
FURNISH & INSTALL

AS 1.000

0700-  1- 11 SINGLE POST SIGN, F&I GROUND MOUNT, UP TO 12 SF AS 489.000

0700-  1- 12 SINGLE POST SIGN, F&I GROUND MOUNT, 12-20 SF AS 489.000

0700-  1- 13 SINGLE POST SIGN, F&I GROUND MOUNT, 21-30 SF AS 489.000

0700-  1- 14 SINGLE POST SIGN, F&I GROUND MOUNT, 31+ SF AS 125.000

0700-  1- 21 SINGLE POST SIGN, F&I BARRIER MOUNT INDEX 11871/700-013 UP 
TO 12 SF

AS 1.000

0700-  1- 22 SINGLE POST SIGN, F&I BARRIER MOUNT INDEX 11871/700-013, 12-
20 SF

AS 1.000

0700-  1- 31 SINGLE POST SIGN, F&I BRIDGE MOUNT INDEX 11870/700-012, UP 
TO 12 SF

AS 25.000

0700-  1- 32 SINGLE POST SIGN, F&I BRIDGE MOUNT INDEX 11870/700-012, 12-20 
SF

AS 25.000

0700-  1- 80 SINGLE POST SIGN, REPAIR AS 300.000

0700-  1- 87 SINGLE POST SIGN, REPAIR- REPLACE POST, USE EXISTING SIGN 
PANEL

AS 200.000

0700-  2- 11 MULTI- POST SIGN, F&I GROUND MOUNT,  UP TO 12 SF AS 10.000

0700-  2- 12 MULTI- POST SIGN, F&I GROUND MOUNT,  12-20 SF AS 10.000

0700-  2- 13 MULTI- POST SIGN, F&I GROUND MOUNT,  21-30 SF AS 10.000

0700-  2- 14 MULTI- POST SIGN, F&I GROUND MOUNT,  31-50 SF AS 10.000

0700-  2- 15 MULTI- POST SIGN, F&I GROUND MOUNT,  51-100 SF AS 11.000

0700-  2- 16 MULTI- POST SIGN, F&I GROUND MOUNT,  101-200 SF AS 22.000

0700-  2- 17 MULTI- POST SIGN, F&I GROUND MOUNT,  201-300 SF AS 22.000

Page 8Bid Solicitation Notice - Proposal Item Quantities



Call Order: 001   Proposal: Z6123

ALT Item Description Unit Quantity

0700-  2- 18 MULTI- POST SIGN, F&I GROUND MOUNT,  301-400 SF AS 5.000

0700-  2- 50 MULTI- POST SIGN, GROUND MOUNT,  RELOCATE AS 1.000

0700-  3-101 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL GROUND MOUNT, UP TO 12 SF EA 473.000

0700-  3-102 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL GROUND MOUNT, 12-20 SF EA 473.000

0700-  3-103 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL GROUND MOUNT, 21-30 SF EA 473.000

0700-  3-104 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL GROUND MOUNT, 31-50 SF EA 158.000

0700-  3-105 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL GROUND MOUNT, 51-100 SF EA 63.000

0700-  3-106 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL GROUND MOUNT, 101-200 SF EA 17.000

0700-  3-107 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL GROUND MOUNT, 201-300 SF EA 17.000

0700-  3-108 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL GROUND MOUNT, 301-400 SF EA 8.000

0700-  3-109 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL GROUND MOUNT, 401-500 SF EA 5.000

0700-  3-201 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL OVERHEAD MOUNT, UP TO 12 SF EA 5.000

0700-  3-202 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL OVERHEAD MOUNT, 12-20 SF EA 10.000

0700-  3-203 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL OVERHEAD MOUNT, 21-30 SF EA 16.000

0700-  3-204 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL OVERHEAD MOUNT, 31-50 SF EA 32.000

0700-  3-205 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL OVERHEAD MOUNT, 51-100 SF EA 16.000

0700-  3-206 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL OVERHEAD MOUNT, 101-200 SF EA 47.000

0700-  3-207 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL OVERHEAD MOUNT, 201-300 SF EA 47.000

0700-  3-208 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL OVERHEAD MOUNT, 301-400 SF EA 31.000

0700-  3-209 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL OVERHEAD MOUNT, 401-500 SF EA 5.000

0700-  3-210 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL OVERHEAD MOUNT, 501-600 SF EA 5.000

0700-  3-211 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL OVERHEAD MOUNT, 601 SF AND 
GREATER

EA 5.000

0700-  3-301 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL SINGLE POST BRIDGE MOUNT 
INDEX 11870/700-012, UP TO 12 SF

EA 10.000

0700-  3-302 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL SINGLE POST BRIDGE MOUNT 
INDEX 11870/700-012, 12-20 SF

EA 10.000

0700-  3-401 SIGN PANEL, INSTALL, UP TO 12 SF EA 165.000

0700-  3-402 SIGN PANEL, INSTALL, 12-20 SF EA 165.000

0700-  3-403 SIGN PANEL, INSTALL, 21-30 SF EA 165.000

0700-  3-404 SIGN PANEL, INSTALL, 31-50 SF EA 68.000

0700-  3-405 SIGN PANEL, INSTALL, 51-100 SF EA 19.000

0700-  3-406 SIGN PANEL, INSTALL, 101-200 SF EA 7.000

0700-  3-407 SIGN PANEL, INSTALL, 201-300 SF EA 1.000

0700-  3-408 SIGN PANEL, INSTALL, 301-400 SF EA 1.000

0700-  4-111 OVERHEAD STATIC SIGN STRUCTURE, FURNISH & INSTALL, 
CANTILEVER, UP TO 20 FT

EA 8.000

0700-  4-112 OVERHEAD STATIC SIGN STRUCTURE, FURNISH & INSTALL, 
CANTILEVER, 21-30 FT

EA 8.000

0700-  4-113 OVERHEAD STATIC SIGN STRUCTURE, FURNISH & INSTALL, 
CANTILEVER, 31-40 FT

EA 8.000

0700-  4-114 OVERHEAD STATIC SIGN STRUCTURE, FURNISH & INSTALL, 
CANTILEVER, 41-50 FT

EA 5.000

0700-  4-121 OVERHEAD STATIC SIGN STRUCTURE, FURNISH & INSTALL, SPAN, 
UP TO 20 FT

EA 5.000

0700-  4-122 OVERHEAD STATIC SIGN STRUCTURE, FURNISH & INSTALL, SPAN, 
21-30 FT

EA 5.000
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Call Order: 001   Proposal: Z6123

ALT Item Description Unit Quantity

0700-  5- 11 INTERNALLY ILLUMINATED SIGN, FURNISH & INSTALL GROUND  
MOUNT, UP TO 12 SF

EA 1.000

0700-  5- 21 INTERNALLY ILLUMINATED SIGN, FURNISH & INSTALL OVERHEAD  
MOUNT, UP TO 12 SF

EA 5.000

0700-  5- 22 INTERNALLY ILLUMINATED SIGN, FURNISH & INSTALL,  OVERHEAD 
MOUNT, 12-18 SF

EA 5.000

0700- 11-121 ELECTRONIC DISPLAY SIGN, FURNISH & INSTALL GROUND MOUNT- 
AC POWERED, ELECTRONIC REGULATORY SIGN, UP TO 12 SF

AS 1.000

0700- 11-321 ELECTRONIC DISPLAY SIGN, FURNISH & INSTALL OVERHEAD 
MOUNT- AC POWERED, REGULATORY SIGN, UP TO 12 SF

AS 1.000

0700- 12- 11 SIGN BEACON, F&I GROUND MOUNT- AC POWERED,  ONE BEACON AS 1.000

0700- 12- 12 SIGN BEACON, F&I GROUND MOUNT- AC POWERED,  TWO BEACONS AS 1.000

0700- 12- 21 SIGN BEACON, F&I GROUND MOUNT- SOLAR POWERED, ONE 
BEACON

AS 1.000

0700- 12- 22 SIGN BEACON, F&I GROUND MOUNT- SOLAR POWERED, TWO 
BEACONS

AS 1.000

0700- 12- 31 SIGN BEACON, F&I OVERHEAD MOUNT,  ONE BEACON AS 1.000

0700- 12- 32 SIGN BEACON, F&I OVERHEAD MOUNT, TWO BEACONS AS 1.000

0700- 12- 60 SIGN BEACON, REMOVE BEACON- SIGN TO REMAIN AS 1.000

0705- 10-  1 OBJECT MARKER, TYPE 1 EA 50.000

0705- 10-  2 OBJECT MARKER, TYPE 2 EA 50.000

0705- 10-  3 OBJECT MARKER, TYPE 3 EA 50.000

0705- 11-  1 DELINEATOR, FLEXIBLE TUBULAR EA 100.000

0705- 11-  2 DELINEATOR, NON-FLEXIBLE EA 100.000

0705- 11-  3 DELINEATOR, FLEXIBLE HIGH VISABILITY MEDIAN EA 100.000

0705- 11-  4 DELINEATOR, FLEXIBLE HIGH PERFORMANCE 48" EA 100.000

E700- 46- 32 REPAIR EXISTING SIGN (MULTI POST) AS 39.000
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Florida Department of Transportation

Bid Solicitation Notice and Approximate Quantities

Letting: 06200520 Call Order: 002 Proposal: Z6124 District:06

Counties: MONROE

Road Name: Emergency Sign Repair and Replacement - Monroe County

Limits: Midpoint

Project(s): 4466281E201(*) Federal Aid No: N/A

Total Roadway Length: 0.000 Miles Contract Days: 365

Total Bridge Length: 0.000 Miles Letting Date: 05/20/20

Total Proposal Length: 0.000 Miles Contract Execution Days: 5

Special Start Date: N/A

Aquis/Flexible Start Time:

Proposal Budget Estimate: $1.00

Please read the full advertisement

Description:

Electronic bids are requested an Emergency (Pre-Event) contract to provide Sign Repair and Replacement Operations in Monroe 
County within District Six. The contractor shall provide all equipment, supplies, and personnel necessary to complete the services 
described in Exhibit 'A' - Scope of Services. No quantities are guaranteed and there will be no unit cost adjustment for quantities 
required over or under the estimated quantities. 

EXPERIENCE REQUIREMENT: Contractors must submit the Experience form in Single and Multi- Post Signs, Form (# 850-070-
08) as an attachment to your electronic bid or your bid may be found Non-Responsive.

ORDER BID DOCUMENTS: To request Bid Documents please use the link below:

https://fdotwp1.dot.state.fl.us/contractproposalprocessingonlineordering/

SPECIAL NOTES:  

( No Bid Bond required

( No Pre-bid Conference

( Work will begin contingent upon legislative budget approval and availability of funds

( Awarded Contractor(s) must execute documents within five (5) workdays, excluding weekends and state holidays.

( Awarded Contractor(s) must provide and keep in force throughout the term of the contract General Liability and Workman's 
Compensation Insurance. The State of Florida Department of Transportation shall be endorsed as additional insured with regards 
to general liability insurance.  

( Upon execution of the contract, the contractor must supply the Department will a letter from a surety authorized to do business 
in the State of Florida, verifying the contractor is bondable in the State of Florida in an amount equal to or greater than the 
amount of the original contract.  The performance bond will be required when work is authorized.

Submit your questions through Bid Question and Answer website and their respective answers will be also posted at this site. 
Please use the link below:

https://fdotwp1.dot.state.fl.us/BidQuestionsAndAnswers/Proposal.aspx/SearchProposal

Call Order: 002   Proposal: Z6124

ALT Item Description Unit Quantity

Section 0001 EMER.DELINEATOR/ATTENUATOR/SIGN REPR(EA)

0630-  2- 11 CONDUIT, FURNISH & INSTALL, OPEN TRENCH LF 10.000
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Call Order: 002   Proposal: Z6124

ALT Item Description Unit Quantity

0630-  2- 12 CONDUIT, FURNISH & INSTALL, DIRECTIONAL BORE LF 5.000

0630-  2- 14 CONDUIT, FURNISH & INSTALL, ABOVEGROUND LF 10.000

0630-  2- 15 CONDUIT, FURNISH & INSTALL, BRIDGE MOUNT LF 5.000

0632-  7-  2 SIGNAL CABLE- REPAIR/REPLACE/OTHER, FURNISH & INSTALL LF 10.000

0634-  4-142 SPAN WIRE ASSEMBLY, F&I, SINGLE POINT, DIAGONAL PI 1.000

0634-  4-152 SPAN WIRE ASSEMBLY, F&I, TWO POINT, DIAGONAL PI 1.000

0635-  2- 11 PULL & SPLICE BOX, F&I, 13" x 24" COVER SIZE EA 1.000

0635-  2- 12 PULL & SPLICE BOX, F&I, 24" X 36" COVER SIZE EA 1.000

0639-  1-111 ELECTRICAL POWER SERVICE, F&I, OVERHEAD, METER FURNISHED 
BY POWER COMPANY

AS 1.000

0639-  1-112 ELECTRICAL POWER SERVICE, F&I, OVERHEAD METER 
PURCHASED BY CONTRACTOR FROM POWER COMPANY

AS 1.000

0639-  1-113 ELECTRICAL POWER SERVICE, F&I, OVERHEAD METER NOT 
REQUIRED

AS 1.000

0639-  1-121 ELECTRICAL POWER SERVICE, F&I, UNDERGROUND, METER 
FURNISHED BY POWER COMPANY

AS 1.000

0639-  1-122 ELECTRICAL POWER SERVICE, F&I, UNDERGROUND, METER 
PURCHASED BY CONTRACTOR

AS 1.000

0639-  1-123 ELECTRICAL POWER SERVICE, F&I, UNDERGROUND, METER NOT 
REQUIRED

AS 1.000

0641-  2- 12 PRESTRESSED CONCRETE POLE, F&I, TYPE P-II SERVICE POLE EA 1.000

0641-  2- 15 PRESTRESSED CONCRETE POLE, F&I, TYPE P-V EA 1.000

0670-  4-  1 INTERSECTION CONTROL BEACON CONTROLLER ASSEMBLY, 
FURNISH & INSTALL

AS 1.000

0700-  1- 11 SINGLE POST SIGN, F&I GROUND MOUNT, UP TO 12 SF AS 350.000

0700-  1- 12 SINGLE POST SIGN, F&I GROUND MOUNT, 12-20 SF AS 200.000

0700-  1- 13 SINGLE POST SIGN, F&I GROUND MOUNT, 21-30 SF AS 100.000

0700-  1- 14 SINGLE POST SIGN, F&I GROUND MOUNT, 31+ SF AS 50.000

0700-  1- 21 SINGLE POST SIGN, F&I BARRIER MOUNT INDEX 11871/700-013 UP 
TO 12 SF

AS 1.000

0700-  1- 22 SINGLE POST SIGN, F&I BARRIER MOUNT INDEX 11871/700-013, 12-
20 SF

AS 1.000

0700-  1- 31 SINGLE POST SIGN, F&I BRIDGE MOUNT INDEX 11870/700-012, UP 
TO 12 SF

AS 5.000

0700-  1- 32 SINGLE POST SIGN, F&I BRIDGE MOUNT INDEX 11870/700-012, 12-20 
SF

AS 1.000

0700-  1- 80 SINGLE POST SIGN, REPAIR AS 1,300.000

0700-  1- 87 SINGLE POST SIGN, REPAIR- REPLACE POST, USE EXISTING SIGN 
PANEL

AS 50.000

0700-  2- 11 MULTI- POST SIGN, F&I GROUND MOUNT,  UP TO 12 SF AS 3.000

0700-  2- 12 MULTI- POST SIGN, F&I GROUND MOUNT,  12-20 SF AS 6.000

0700-  2- 13 MULTI- POST SIGN, F&I GROUND MOUNT,  21-30 SF AS 6.000

0700-  2- 14 MULTI- POST SIGN, F&I GROUND MOUNT,  31-50 SF AS 6.000

0700-  2- 15 MULTI- POST SIGN, F&I GROUND MOUNT,  51-100 SF AS 3.000

0700-  2- 16 MULTI- POST SIGN, F&I GROUND MOUNT,  101-200 SF AS 3.000

0700-  2- 17 MULTI- POST SIGN, F&I GROUND MOUNT,  201-300 SF AS 1.000

0700-  2- 18 MULTI- POST SIGN, F&I GROUND MOUNT,  301-400 SF AS 1.000

0700-  2- 50 MULTI- POST SIGN, GROUND MOUNT,  RELOCATE AS 1.000
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Call Order: 002   Proposal: Z6124

ALT Item Description Unit Quantity

0700-  3-101 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL GROUND MOUNT, UP TO 12 SF EA 200.000

0700-  3-102 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL GROUND MOUNT, 12-20 SF EA 150.000

0700-  3-103 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL GROUND MOUNT, 21-30 SF EA 75.000

0700-  3-104 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL GROUND MOUNT, 31-50 SF EA 25.000

0700-  3-105 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL GROUND MOUNT, 51-100 SF EA 20.000

0700-  3-106 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL GROUND MOUNT, 101-200 SF EA 10.000

0700-  3-107 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL GROUND MOUNT, 201-300 SF EA 10.000

0700-  3-108 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL GROUND MOUNT, 301-400 SF EA 10.000

0700-  3-109 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL GROUND MOUNT, 401-500 SF EA 10.000

0700-  3-201 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL OVERHEAD MOUNT, UP TO 12 SF EA 5.000

0700-  3-202 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL OVERHEAD MOUNT, 12-20 SF EA 5.000

0700-  3-203 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL OVERHEAD MOUNT, 21-30 SF EA 1.000

0700-  3-204 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL OVERHEAD MOUNT, 31-50 SF EA 1.000

0700-  3-205 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL OVERHEAD MOUNT, 51-100 SF EA 1.000

0700-  3-206 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL OVERHEAD MOUNT, 101-200 SF EA 1.000

0700-  3-207 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL OVERHEAD MOUNT, 201-300 SF EA 1.000

0700-  3-208 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL OVERHEAD MOUNT, 301-400 SF EA 1.000

0700-  3-209 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL OVERHEAD MOUNT, 401-500 SF EA 1.000

0700-  3-210 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL OVERHEAD MOUNT, 501-600 SF EA 1.000

0700-  3-211 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL OVERHEAD MOUNT, 601 SF AND 
GREATER

EA 1.000

0700-  3-301 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL SINGLE POST BRIDGE MOUNT 
INDEX 11870/700-012, UP TO 12 SF

EA 12.000

0700-  3-302 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL SINGLE POST BRIDGE MOUNT 
INDEX 11870/700-012, 12-20 SF

EA 1.000

0700-  3-401 SIGN PANEL, INSTALL, UP TO 12 SF EA 1.000

0700-  3-402 SIGN PANEL, INSTALL, 12-20 SF EA 1.000

0700-  3-403 SIGN PANEL, INSTALL, 21-30 SF EA 1.000

0700-  3-404 SIGN PANEL, INSTALL, 31-50 SF EA 1.000

0700-  3-405 SIGN PANEL, INSTALL, 51-100 SF EA 1.000

0700-  3-406 SIGN PANEL, INSTALL, 101-200 SF EA 1.000

0700-  3-407 SIGN PANEL, INSTALL, 201-300 SF EA 1.000

0700-  3-408 SIGN PANEL, INSTALL, 301-400 SF EA 1.000

0700-  4-111 OVERHEAD STATIC SIGN STRUCTURE, FURNISH & INSTALL, 
CANTILEVER, UP TO 20 FT

EA 1.000

0700-  4-112 OVERHEAD STATIC SIGN STRUCTURE, FURNISH & INSTALL, 
CANTILEVER, 21-30 FT

EA 1.000

0700-  4-113 OVERHEAD STATIC SIGN STRUCTURE, FURNISH & INSTALL, 
CANTILEVER, 31-40 FT

EA 1.000

0700-  4-114 OVERHEAD STATIC SIGN STRUCTURE, FURNISH & INSTALL, 
CANTILEVER, 41-50 FT

EA 1.000

0700-  4-121 OVERHEAD STATIC SIGN STRUCTURE, FURNISH & INSTALL, SPAN, 
UP TO 20 FT

EA 1.000

0700-  4-122 OVERHEAD STATIC SIGN STRUCTURE, FURNISH & INSTALL, SPAN, 
21-30 FT

EA 1.000

0700-  5- 11 INTERNALLY ILLUMINATED SIGN, FURNISH & INSTALL GROUND  
MOUNT, UP TO 12 SF

EA 1.000
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Call Order: 002   Proposal: Z6124

ALT Item Description Unit Quantity

0700-  5- 21 INTERNALLY ILLUMINATED SIGN, FURNISH & INSTALL OVERHEAD  
MOUNT, UP TO 12 SF

EA 6.000

0700-  5- 22 INTERNALLY ILLUMINATED SIGN, FURNISH & INSTALL,  OVERHEAD 
MOUNT, 12-18 SF

EA 4.000

0700- 11-121 ELECTRONIC DISPLAY SIGN, FURNISH & INSTALL GROUND MOUNT- 
AC POWERED, ELECTRONIC REGULATORY SIGN, UP TO 12 SF

AS 1.000

0700- 11-321 ELECTRONIC DISPLAY SIGN, FURNISH & INSTALL OVERHEAD 
MOUNT- AC POWERED, REGULATORY SIGN, UP TO 12 SF

AS 1.000

0700- 12- 11 SIGN BEACON, F&I GROUND MOUNT- AC POWERED,  ONE BEACON AS 1.000

0700- 12- 12 SIGN BEACON, F&I GROUND MOUNT- AC POWERED,  TWO BEACONS AS 1.000

0700- 12- 21 SIGN BEACON, F&I GROUND MOUNT- SOLAR POWERED, ONE 
BEACON

AS 1.000

0700- 12- 22 SIGN BEACON, F&I GROUND MOUNT- SOLAR POWERED, TWO 
BEACONS

AS 1.000

0700- 12- 31 SIGN BEACON, F&I OVERHEAD MOUNT,  ONE BEACON AS 1.000

0700- 12- 32 SIGN BEACON, F&I OVERHEAD MOUNT, TWO BEACONS AS 1.000

0700- 12- 60 SIGN BEACON, REMOVE BEACON- SIGN TO REMAIN AS 1.000

0705- 10-  1 OBJECT MARKER, TYPE 1 EA 25.000

0705- 10-  2 OBJECT MARKER, TYPE 2 EA 5.000

0705- 10-  3 OBJECT MARKER, TYPE 3 EA 10.000

0705- 11-  1 DELINEATOR, FLEXIBLE TUBULAR EA 100.000

0705- 11-  3 DELINEATOR, FLEXIBLE HIGH VISABILITY MEDIAN EA 20.000

E700- 46- 32 REPAIR EXISTING SIGN (MULTI POST) AS 6.000
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Florida Department of Transportation

Bid Solicitation Notice and Approximate Quantities

Letting: 06200520 Call Order: 003 Proposal: Z6125-R0 District:06

Counties: MIAMI-DADE

Road Name: Emergency Cut and Toss - Miami-Dade County

Limits: Midpoint

Project(s): 4466291D201(*) Federal Aid No: N/A

Total Roadway Length: 0.000 Miles Contract Days: 365

Total Bridge Length: 0.000 Miles Letting Date: 05/20/20

Total Proposal Length: 0.000 Miles Contract Execution Days: 5

Special Start Date: N/A

Aquis/Flexible Start Time:

Proposal Budget Estimate: $1.00

Please read the full advertisement

Description:

Electronic bids are requested for an Emergency (Pre-Event) Contract to provide Cut and Toss Operations in Miami-Dade County 
within District Six. The contractor shall provide all equipment, supplies, and personnel necessary to complete the services 
described in Exhibit A - Scope of Services.  The Department, at its sole discretion, may award one or more contracts.  If more 
than one award is made, award will be based on the lowest responsive bid then the next lowest responsive bid and so forth and 
activated in the same order based on Contractor availability and ability to satisfy the needs of the Department at the time 
contacted. No quantities are guaranteed and there will be no unit cost adjustment for quantities required over or under the 
estimated quantities.  

SPECIAL NOTES:  

-No Bid Bond required
-No Pre-bid Conference
-Work will begin contingent upon legislative budget approval and availability of funds
-Awarded Contractor(s) must execute documents within five (5) Business days, excluding weekends and state holidays
-Awarded Contractor(s) must provide and keep in force throughout the term of the contract General Liability and Workman 
Compensation Insurance.  The State of Florida Department of Transportation shall be endorsed as additional insured with 
regards to General Liability Insurance.  
-Upon execution of the contract, the contractor must supply the Department with a letter from a surety authorized to do business 
in the State of Florida, verifying the contractor is bondable in the State of Florida in an amount equal to or greater than the 
amount of the original contract.  The performance bond will be required when work is authorized.

Submit your questions through Bid Question and Answer website and their respective answers will be also posted at this site. 
Please use the link below:

https://fdotwp1.dot.state.fl.us/BidQuestionsAndAnswers/Proposal.aspx/SearchProposal

Call Order: 003   Proposal: Z6125-R0

ALT Item Description Unit Quantity

Section 0001 MONITOR,RESPOND,RECOVER-STORMS (MH)

0129-  1-  1 NATURAL DISASTER /PRE EVENT CONTRACTS, CREW PRE-
POSITIONING: DO NOT BID

ED 1.000

0129-  1-  2 NATURAL DISASTER /PRE EVENT CONTRACTS, CUT AND TOSS HR 1.000
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Florida Department of Transportation

Bid Solicitation Notice and Approximate Quantities

Letting: 06200520 Call Order: 004 Proposal: Z6126-R0 District:06

Counties: MONROE

Road Name: Emergency Cut and Toss - Monroe County

Limits: Midpoint

Project(s): 4466301D201(*) Federal Aid No: N/A

Total Roadway Length: 0.000 Miles Contract Days: 365

Total Bridge Length: 0.000 Miles Letting Date: 05/20/20

Total Proposal Length: 0.000 Miles Contract Execution Days: 5

Special Start Date: N/A

Aquis/Flexible Start Time:

Proposal Budget Estimate: $1.00

Please read the full advertisement

Description:

Electronic bids are requested for an Emergency (Pre-Event) Contract to provide Cut and Toss Operations in Monroe County 
within District Six. The contractor shall provide all equipment, supplies, and personnel necessary to complete the services 
described in Exhibit A  Scope of Services.  The Department, at its sole discretion, may award one or more contracts.  If more 
than one award is made, award will be based on the lowest responsive bid then the next lowest responsive bid and so forth and 
activated in the same order based on Contractor availability and ability to satisfy the needs of the Department at the time 
contacted. No quantities are guaranteed and there will be no unit cost adjustment for quantities required over or under the 
estimated quantities.  

SPECIAL NOTES:  

-No Bid Bond required
-No Pre-bid Conference
-Work will begin contingent upon legislative budget approval and availability of funds
-Awarded Contractor (s) must execute documents within five (5) Business days, excluding weekends and state holidays
-Awarded Contractor(s) must provide and keep in force throughout the term of the contract General Liability and Workman's 
Compensation Insurance.  The State of Florida Department of Transportation shall be endorsed as additional insured with 
regards to General Liability Insurance.  
-Upon execution of the contract, the contractor must supply the Department with a letter from a surety authorized to do business 
in the State of Florida, verifying the contractor is bondable in the State of Florida in an amount equal to or greater than the 
amount of the original contract.  The performance bond will be required when work is authorized.

Submit your questions through Bid Question and Answer website and their respective answers will be also posted at this site. 
Please use the link below:

https://fdotwp1.dot.state.fl.us/BidQuestionsAndAnswers/Proposal.aspx/SearchProposal

Call Order: 004   Proposal: Z6126-R0

ALT Item Description Unit Quantity

Section 0001 MONITOR,RESPOND,RECOVER-STORMS (MH)

0129-  1-  1 NATURAL DISASTER /PRE EVENT CONTRACTS, CREW PRE-
POSITIONING: DO NOT BID

ED 1.000

0129-  1-  2 NATURAL DISASTER /PRE EVENT CONTRACTS, CUT AND TOSS HR 1.000

Page 16Bid Solicitation Notice - Proposal Item Quantities


